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The rights of a pupil and the public and the responsibilities of 
the school district under Title IX, which shall include, but shall 
not be limited to, Internet Web links to information about those 
rights and responsibilities located on the Internet Web sites of 
the department’s Office for Equal Opportunity and the United 
States Department of Education Office of Civil Rights, and the 
list of rights specified in Section 221.8. 
 

● US Department of Education, Office for Civil Rights 

● Office of U.S. Equal Employment Opportunity Commission 

● Section 221.8 Rights: The following list of rights, which are 
based on the relevant provisions of the federal regulations 
implementing Title IX of the Education Amendments of 1972 
(20 U.S.C. Sec. 1681 et seq.), may be used by the department for 
purposes of Section 221.6: (a) You have the right to fair and 
equitable treatment and you shall not be discriminated against 
based on your sex. (b) You have the right to be provided with an 
equitable opportunity to participate in all academic 
extracurricular activities, including athletics. (c) You have the 
right to inquire of the athletic director of your school as to the 
athletic opportunities offered by the school. (d) You have the 
right to apply for athletic scholarships. (e) You have the right to 
receive equitable treatment and benefits in the provision of all of 
the following: (1) Equipment and supplies. (2) Scheduling of 
games and practices. (3) Transportation and daily allowances. 
(4) Access to tutoring. (5) Coaching. (6) Locker rooms. 
(7) Practice and competitive facilities. (8) Medical and training 
facilities and services. (9) Publicity. (f) You have the right to 
have access to a gender equity coordinator to answer questions 
regarding gender equity laws. (g) You have the right to contact 
the State Department of Education and the California 

https://www.eeoc.gov/
https://www2.ed.gov/about/offices/list/ocr/index.html


Interscholastic Federation to access information on gender equity 
laws. (h) You have the right to file a confidential discrimination 
complaint with the United States Office of Civil Rights or the 
State Department of Education if you believe you have been 
discriminated against or if you believe you have received 
unequal treatment on the basis of your sex. (i) You have the right 
to pursue civil remedies if you have been discriminated against. 
(j) You have the right to be protected against retaliation if you 
file a discrimination complaint. 

A description of how to file a complaint under Title IX 
● A written complaint alleging district violation of applicable state 

or federal law or regulations governing adult education 
programs, consolidated categorical aid programs, migrant 
education, career technical and technical education and training 
programs, child care and development programs, child nutrition 
programs, and special education programs may be filed by any 
individual, public agency, or organization. (5 CCR �4630�) 

● Any complaint alleging noncompliance with law regarding the 
prohibition against requiring students to pay student fees, 
deposits, and charges or any requirement related to the LCAP 
may be filed anonymously if the complaint provides evidence, or 
information leading to evidence, to support an allegation of 
noncompliance. A complaint about a violation of the prohibition 
against the charging of unlawful student fees may be filed with 
the principal of the school. However, any such complaint shall 
be filed no later than one year from the date the alleged violation 
occurred. (Education Code �49013�,� �52075�; 5 CCR �4630�) 

● A complaint alleging unlawful discrimination (such as 
discriminatory harassment, intimidation, or bullying) may be 
filed only by a person who alleges that he/she personally 

https://leginfo.legislature.ca.gov/faces/codes_displaySection.xhtml?lawCode=EDC&sectionNum=49013.
http://leginfo.legislature.ca.gov/faces/codes_displaySection.xhtml?lawCode=EDC&sectionNum=52075.
https://govt.westlaw.com/calregs/Document/IBC800D0027D611E3A241A8038D8BCC68?viewType=FullText&originationContext=documenttoc&transitionType=CategoryPageItem&contextData=(sc.Default)
https://govt.westlaw.com/calregs/Document/IBC800D0027D611E3A241A8038D8BCC68?viewType=FullText&originationContext=documenttoc&transitionType=CategoryPageItem&contextData=(sc.Default)
http://leginfo.legislature.ca.gov/faces/codes_displaySection.xhtml?lawCode=EDC&sectionNum=52075.
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https://drive.google.com/a/cvusd.co/file/d/0Bw2FO1fNNHaQT3NqVjhsTHVrUlk/view?usp=sharing
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